



Date: 07/12/2023
Our ref: 01/FOI/23/011597/W

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/23/011597/W

I write in connection with your request for information dated 02/11/2023, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

Below I have outlined the data fields I'm interested in and I'd like to request the data for the 12 months from 1 January 2022 to 31 December 2022 (inclusive), and from 1 January 2023 to 31 October 2023 (inclusive). If possible, I'd like the data to be broken down by month-by-month to show:

- 1) How many speeding offences were detected by Greater Manchester Police?*
- 2) How many speeding offences detected by Greater Manchester Police were cars?*
- 3) How many speeding offences detected by Greater Manchester Police were hybrid electric cars?*
- 4) How many speeding offences detected by Greater Manchester Police were fully electric cars?*
- 5) How many speeding offences detected by Greater Manchester Police were diesel cars?*
- 6) How many speeding offences detected by Greater Manchester Police were petrol cars?*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate the requested information and I can confirm that some of the information requested is held by GMP.

1.

2022											
Jan	Feb	Mar	Apr	May	Jun	Jul	Aug	Sep	Oct	Nov	Dec
12127	9874	12327	15904	15935	22653	11187	18819	12407	11193	7889	3675

2023									
Jan	Feb	Mar	Apr	May	Jun	Jul	Aug	Sep	Oct
7933	12587	14167	14714	13527	18478	13329	15585	10636	11225

2-6. This information is not held by Greater Manchester Police. Fuel type of the vehicles is not recorded, so we are unable to provide this information.