



Date: 18/07/2023
Our ref: 01/FOI/23/004422/H

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/23/004422/H

I write in connection with your request for information dated 09/07/2023, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

Please may I request the following information year by year from 2013 until 2023 for the following separate offences. Domestic abuse, coercive and controlling behaviour, harassment, stalking, sexual assault, rape (separated by adult victims and child victims), indecent exposure. To categorise all female defendants and male defendants separately in each offence:

1. The number of crimes reported for each offence
2. The percentage that resulted in a criminal charge
3. The percentage that resulted in a successful conviction
4. The percentage of trials that resulted in a not guilty
5. The total cost to the tax payer in legal aid costs for both, the guilty and the not guilty.

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate the requested information and I can confirm the information requested is held by GMP.

CAVEATS:

- There is no offence category for domestic abuse – this is a qualifier/flag that can be applied to all crime types that are domestic abuse related. The applicant would need to let us know which specific offences they would like us to search for to see if the qualifier/flag has been applied.

- In July 2019, GMP implemented a new operating system. The system is in continual development and the data provided for this request is what the system currently holds.
- The data provided for this request is subject to change as crimes are progressed and/or updated.
- 'Missing Value' means that this field hasn't been populated on our operating systems.

The data provided for this request is based on a search of the below offence categories recorded between 01/01/2013 – 31/12/2022 inclusive:

- 8U Controlling or Coercive Behaviour
- 8Q Stalking
- 8L Harassment
- 17A Sexual Assault on a Male Aged 13 and Over
- 17B Sexual Assault on a Male Under 13
- 20A Sexual Assault on a Female Aged 13 or Over
- 20B Sexual Assault on a Female Under 13
- 19C Rape of a Female Aged 16 and Over
- 19D Rape of a Female Under 16
- 19E Rape of a Female Under 13
- 19F Rape of a Male Aged 16 and Over
- 19G Rape of a Male Under 16
- 19H Rape of a Male Under 13
- 88E Exposure and Voyeurism

1.

Volume of Offences, Broken Down by Calendar Year										
Offence Level	2013	2014	2015	2016	2017	2018	2019	2020	2021	2022
17A Sexual Assault on a Male Aged 13 and Over	79	87	121	126	199	165	231	330	356	526
17B Sexual Assault on a Male Under 13	65	113	101	152	187	178	194	188	255	269
19C Rape of a Female Aged 16 and Over	520	803	853	1006	1374	1435	1682	1808	2122	2261
19D Rape of a Female Under 16	232	219	295	252	367	298	348	381	549	553
19E Rape of a Female Under 13	94	146	179	155	259	301	311	264	336	280
19F Rape of a Male Aged 16 and Over	16	38	33	49	180	68	115	152	137	182

19G Rape of a Male Under 16	15	52	40	58	59	41	48	50	65	70
19H Rape of a Male Under 13	37	66	77	100	110	145	131	104	130	106
20A Sexual Assault on a Female Aged 13 or Over	507	669	865	790	1066	1177	1344	1394	2038	2539
20B Sexual Assault on a Female Under 13	179	246	264	296	386	389	132	0	0	0
88E Exposure and Voyeurism	11	36	30	33	47	32	69	61	113	120
8L Harassment	2107	3010	3865	4038	5253	7133	7592	6927	11420	13761
8Q Stalking	60	132	175	164	175	322	600	3170	8254	8887
8U Controlling or Coercive Behaviour	0	0	1	159	629	827	983	1256	2435	2893
Total	3922	5617	6899	7378	10291	12511	13780	16085	28210	32447

Volume of Female and Male Suspects											
Offence Level	Suspect Gender	2013	2014	2015	2016	2017	2018	2019	2020	2021	2022
17A Sexual Assault on a Male Aged 13 and Over	Female	6	6	11	12	39	34	54	64	84	108
	Male	73	80	103	113	167	134	138	170	173	258
	Missing Value	5	4	9	4	5	3	48	111	120	197
17B Sexual Assault on a Male Under 13	Female	0	9	16	9	27	33	27	28	36	38
	Male	60	104	84	143	163	146	147	134	178	179
	Missing Value	5	6	7	6	3	4	28	36	68	78
19C Rape of a Female Aged 16 and Over	Female	1	6	3	6	8	15	13	8	10	19
	Male	555	839	885	1039	1400	1476	1483	1525	1868	1934
	Missing Value	26	31	37	27	17	25	331	436	464	540
19D Rape of a Female Under 16	Female	1	1	2	1	4	0	0	1	3	3
	Male	266	223	326	267	380	311	341	310	443	415
	Missing Value	9	11	21	13	1	6	45	125	189	194
19E Rape of a Female Under 13	Female	1	4	4	0	4	7	3	3	3	2
	Male	93	142	180	160	266	304	308	222	290	226
	Missing Value	3	6	8	0	6	8	39	63	85	81
19F Rape of a Male Aged 16 and Over	Female	0	0	0	3	0	3	1	0	0	0
	Male	14	38	44	55	177	70	83	84	67	97
	Missing Value	2	2	4	2	3	1	44	80	79	97
19G Rape of a Male Under 16	Female	0	1	3	1	0	0	0	1	3	0
	Male	14	55	43	66	56	44	39	48	45	54
	Missing Value	1	3	1	0	5	0	10	14	25	24
19H Rape of a Male Under 13	Female	0	1	2	2	2	2	1	1	0	0
	Male	43	66	76	104	113	143	112	86	103	90
	Missing Value	1	5	4	0	2	2	28	29	37	21
20A Sexual Assault on a Female Aged 13 or Over	Female	8	12	20	20	35	44	45	40	79	114
	Male	511	639	815	764	1048	1136	1009	1050	1428	1678
	Missing Value	24	40	65	27	22	38	350	441	683	920
	Female	2	12	20	22	36	40	15	0	0	0
	Male	171	220	236	270	353	348	118	0	0	0

20B Sexual Assault on a Female Under 13	Missing Value	10	23	18	11	11	8	2	0	0	0
88E Exposure and Voyeurism	Female	0	0	0	0	2	1	1	3	2	6
	Male	11	34	28	32	45	29	53	45	93	82
	Missing Value	0	2	2	1	1	2	17	20	32	37
8L Harassment	Female	225	417	703	793	1210	1918	2217	2185	3811	4834
	Male	1866	2597	3144	3251	4131	5383	4867	3369	5276	6105
	Missing Value	53	81	126	98	52	100	1059	2100	3919	4811
8Q Stalking	Female	12	25	42	23	32	45	100	615	1795	1969
	Male	51	118	132	140	146	278	466	2505	6351	6777
	Missing Value	3	6	9	7	1	6	85	279	735	838
8U Controlling or Coercive Behaviour	Female	0	0	0	11	40	67	108	134	292	347
	Male	0	0	1	154	604	773	921	1185	2291	2615
	Missing Value	0	0	0	2	6	8	17	29	53	127
Total		4126	5869	7234	7659	10623	12995	14773	17579	31213	35915

2.

Volume of Offences with 'Charge (1A)' or 'Charged Alternative Offence (1C)'											
Offence Level	2013	2014	2015	2016	2017	2018	2019	2020	2021	2022	
17A Sexual Assault on a Male Aged 13 and Over	49%	22%	18%	15%	8%	10%	5%	5%	3%	3%	
17B Sexual Assault on a Male Under 13	42%	20%	17%	14%	12%	10%	10%	14%	8%	3%	
19C Rape of a Female Aged 16 and Over	33%	22%	20%	15%	6%	5%	5%	6%	5%	4%	
19D Rape of a Female Under 16	51%	33%	31%	16%	12%	14%	13%	11%	7%	5%	
19E Rape of a Female Under 13	52%	41%	31%	27%	12%	12%	16%	11%	12%	3%	
19F Rape of a Male Aged 16 and Over	25%	16%	9%	10%	28%	4%	3%	3%	1%	3%	
19G Rape of a Male Under 16	33%	17%	30%	19%	5%	17%	6%	16%	5%	4%	
19H Rape of a Male Under 13	49%	33%	16%	20%	7%	12%	12%	11%	7%	2%	
20A Sexual Assault on a Female Aged 13 or Over	40%	29%	27%	24%	14%	12%	9%	9%	9%	7%	
20B Sexual Assault on a Female Under 13	44%	24%	25%	16%	9%	5%	1%	N/A	N/A	N/A	
88E Exposure and Voyeurism	73%	58%	43%	45%	23%	9%	20%	20%	30%	8%	
8L Harassment	58%	54%	44%	37%	25%	19%	10%	4%	3%	3%	

8Q Stalking	38%	39%	26%	21%	16%	19%	16%	10%	9%	10%
8U Controlling or Coercive Behaviour	N/A	N/A	0%	30%	18%	10%	8%	9%	7%	9%
Total	50%	42%	36%	29%	19%	15%	9%	7%	6%	6%

3. GMP do not hold data about convictions. This would have to be obtained from His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service.
4. GMP do not hold data about convictions. This would have to be obtained from His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service.
5. GMP do not hold data about Legal Aid. I recommend you contact the Legal Aid Board to obtain this information.