



Date: 10/04/2024
Our ref: 01/FOI/24/012280/D

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/24/012280/D

I write in connection with your request for information dated 08/03/2024, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

- 1. The estimated total number of acres of land that you own.*
- 2. The estimated total number of acres that you own which are not in operational use.*
- 3. The annual spending on managing and maintaining your property estate in the financial year 2022/23. Please provide a breakdown.*
- 4. The number of empty homes you currently own.*
- 5. The number of empty buildings you currently own that are not homes.*
- 6. Please provide a copy of your asset register.*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by GMP.

1. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact the Greater Manchester Combined Authority for this information.
2. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact the Greater Manchester Combined Authority for this information.

3.

Category	2022/23
Maintenance	£4,680,758.59
Building Works/Decommissioning	£10,289,484.75

4. 0.

5. 2.

6. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact the Greater Manchester Combined Authority for this information.