



Date: 29/02/2024
Our ref: 01/FOI/24/012084/B

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/24/012084/B

I write in connection with your request for information dated 06/02/2024, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

1. How many people whose profession was to deliver food (ie. Deliveroo drivers, UberEats drivers, and JustEat drivers) have been charged with sexual harassment in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023?
2. How many people whose profession was to deliver food (ie. Deliveroo drivers, UberEats drivers, and JustEat drivers) have been charged with sexual abuse in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023?
3. How many people whose profession was to deliver food (ie. Deliveroo drivers, UberEats drivers, and JustEat drivers) have been charged with rape in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023?
4. How many people whose profession was to deliver food (ie. Deliveroo drivers, UberEats drivers, and JustEat drivers) have been charged with indecent exposure in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023?
5. How many people whose profession was to deliver food (ie. Deliveroo drivers, UberEats drivers, and JustEat drivers) have been charged with upskirting in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023?

If you cannot provide me with this information, can you please tell me:

6. How many charges of sexual harassment in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023 contained the key words: "food delivery", "food delivery driver", "UberEats", "JustEat", and "Deliveroo" ?
7. How many charges of sexual assault in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023 contained the key words: "food delivery", "food delivery driver", "UberEats", "JustEat", "Deliveroo"?
8. How many charges of rape in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023 contained the key words: "food delivery", "food delivery driver", "UberEats", "JustEat", "Deliveroo"?
9. How many charges of indecent exposure in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023 contained the key words: "food delivery", "food delivery driver", "UberEats", "JustEat", "Deliveroo"?
10. How many charges of upskirting in the years 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, and 2023 contained the key words: "food delivery", "food delivery driver", "UberEats", "JustEat", "Deliveroo"?

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that the information you have requested is held by GMP.

CAVEATS

Searches were conducted on the Home Office Offence Categories 'Rape' and 'Other Sexual Offences' (includes Sexual Assault, Indecent Exposure, and Upskirting) recorded between 01/01/2019 and 31/12/2023 inclusive.

There is no official Home Office offence category of 'sexual harassment' so we cannot search for this.

The data was filtered to only show crimes with an outcome of 'Charge (1A)'.

For questions 1-5, there is no searchable field for a suspect's employment. We have therefore used the key words provided by you in questions 6-10 and searched on the 'Crime MO Description' and 'Crime Description' fields.

Please note:

- The keyword methodology does not account for spelling errors.
- The appearance or absence of the keywords in the text fields does not necessarily mean that records are relevant to this request.

In July 2019, GMP implemented one of the largest IT infrastructure changes in UK policing – the systems are in continual development and the data provided for this request is what the systems currently hold. Any data provided for this request is subject to change as crimes are progressed and/or updated.

1. This information is not held by GMP. There is no Home Office Offence Category for sexual harassment.
2. 0
3. 0
4. 0
5. 0
6. This information is not held by GMP. There is no Home Office Offence Category for sexual harassment.
7. 0
8. 0
9. 0
10. 0