



Date: 24/09/2024
Our ref: 01/FOI/24/013178/K

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/24/013178/K

I write in connection with your request for information dated 28/08/2024, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

I would like to please submit an FOI request for the following data for the period of July 2023 to July 2024:

1. *The number of motorists who have been sent a letter giving them the option to pay and complete a speed awareness course as an alternative for receiving points on their license.*
2. *The location of the motorist who has been sent the letter.*
3. *The cost of the course the motorist must pay in lieu of the points on their license.*
4. *The number of motorists that have failed to complete/remain present for the duration of the speed awareness course.*
5. *Additional data: Is there any data on how many of these motorists have not shown up for the course after booking it.*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by GMP.

1. 110,789
- 2.

BOLTON	7931
BURY	2320
MANCHESTER	14757
OLDHAM	7560

ROCHDALE	3261
SALFORD	5639
STOCKPORT	3744
TAMESIDE	4217
TRAFFORD	8073
WIGAN	8984
M56	5
M6	838
M60	9296
M602	6
M61	45
M62	31625
M65	1
M66	20
M67	2466
WEST YORKSHIRE	1
TOTAL	110789

3. Course costs are set and administered by the various different course providers so GMP cannot provide this information.
4. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact the individual course providers for this information.
5. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact the individual course providers for this information.