



Date: 27/11/2025
Our ref: 01/FOI/25/015760/Z

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/25/015760/Z

I write in connection with your request for information dated 03/11/2025, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

1. *How many drivers were stopped by officers in your force area on December 24, 2024?*
2. *How many of the drivers stopped were subject to any kind of action regarding the safety of their tyres? (e.g. drivers advised to replace worn tyres, drivers instructed to replace worn tyres or face enforcement action, vehicles taken off the road due to poor tyre condition)*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by GMP.

1. 68.
2. This information is not held by GMP. This level of detail is not recorded.