

Date: 29th May 2025
Our ref: FOI/25/014782/B

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: FOI/25/014782/B

I write in connection with your request for information dated 16/05/2025, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act regarding rates of VAWG related offences in the boroughs of Greater Manchester (Bury, Salford etc). I would like to know the total numbers of incidents and the total number of incidents not recorded as a crime where the victim was a women and the perpetrator a man. I would like details of the following crimes:

***Murder**
Domestic violence
Rape and serious sexual assault
Stalking
Digital assault
FGM (female genital mutilation)
Intimate Abuse Abuse
Forced marriage*

CLARIFICATION

Please can I figures from 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024.

CLARIFICATION

I really want the crime stats, not just the incidents, and if I have to choose, the crime stats only.

CLARIFICATION

I will have meant Intimate Image Abuse (known colloquially as deep fakes or revenge porn).

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate the requested information and I can confirm the information requested is held by GMP.

Caveats:

In July 2019, GMP implemented one of the largest IT infrastructure changes in UK policing. The systems are in continual development and the data provided for this request is what the systems currently hold.

1. The period considered is 01/01/2020-31/12/2024. The data has been displayed by calendar year at both Force & District level.
2. The month relates to when the Crime was recorded and not when the incident occurred.
3. Where possible duplicates have been removed.
4. Please see the 'HO Code' tab for full details of crimes included within each of the categories. D/V crimes are all crimes with a DA Flag.
5. Other/ Not Recorded/ Unknown includes crimes where the District has not been recorded & crimes occurring at the Airport.
6. For 'Deep fake' crimes the keywords 'Deep Fake' & 'Revenge' have been searched on & then the MO Descriptions read to establish if the crime falls into this category.
7. Please note there will be some duplication across some of the categories & the Domestic Violence figures.
8. Crimes are based on female victim & male perpetrator.

Due to low numbers being returned, FGM crimes have been exempt from disclosure under Section 40(2) Personal Information – this information constitutes personal data of an identifiable living individual, and to disclose this information would breach the principles of the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and the Data Protection Act 2018. Personal data is defined by Section 1 of the Data Protection Act 2018 and means data that relates to an individual who can be identified directly or indirectly from that data.

Due to low numbers being returned, some of the totals have been replaced with X, as by providing all this information split by district, year and crime type as you have requested would significantly increase the likelihood of identifying the individual(s) concerned, and as such the exemption under S40(2) – Personal Information, would be engaged and result in information being refused. By replacing this data in this way, it can be provided in its entirety.

FORCE LEVEL	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes'/'Revenge')
2020	11	30,104	6,616	17,716	12	12
2021	17	42,149	8,640	30,056	22	14
2022	6	44,885	9,074	33,787	35	24
2023	9	41,709	8,828	33,730	64	76
2024	X	37,926	9,200	27,913	36	84
Total	49	196,773	42,358	143,202	169	210

CoM Central	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	973	518	511	X	0
2021	X	1,610	718	1,085	X	X
2022	X	1,966	905	1,219	X	0
2023	X	1,704	862	1,111	X	7
2024	X	1,633	869	1,069	X	7

CoM North	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	3,079	808	1,611	X	0
2021	X	4,856	987	2,975	X	X
2022	X	4,990	1,032	3,373	X	X
2023	X	4,347	882	3,244	11	8
2024	X	4,032	889	2,628	X	7

CoM South	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	1,872	440	1,073	X	0
2021	X	3,075	569	2,307	0	X
2022	X	3,266	657	2,409	X	X
2023	X	3,077	603	2,507	X	6
2024	X	2,723	659	2,086	X	8

Salford	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	3,152	673	1,883	0	X
2021	X	3,937	706	2,793	X	0
2022	X	4,716	830	3,268	X	X
2023	X	4,362	768	3,409	X	14
2024	X	3,828	885	2,769	0	11

Tameside	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	2,734	485	1,793	0	X
2021	X	3,997	611	2,936	0	X
2022	X	4,009	613	3,134	X	X
2023	X	3,529	648	2,887	X	6
2024	X	3,067	738	2,427	X	X

Stockport	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	2,456	510	1,540	X	0
2021	X	2,815	632	2,023	X	0
2022	X	3,107	674	2,406	X	X
2023	X	2,955	622	2,428	X	X
2024	X	2,501	676	2,009	X	7

Bolton	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	3,502	637	1,977	X	X
2021	X	4,326	831	3,195	X	X
2022	X	4,886	941	3,792	X	X
2023	X	4,474	899	3,745	10	6
2024	X	4,261	896	3,139	X	8

Wigan	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	3,619	614	2,050	0	X
2021	X	4,788	853	3,429	0	0
2022	X	5,173	821	3,879	X	X
2023	X	5,085	857	4,022	X	X
2024	X	4,555	890	3,335	X	X

Trafford	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	1,398	362	930	0	0
2021	X	2,030	422	1,547	0	X
2022	X	2,140	449	1,739	0	X
2023	X	2,053	506	1,677	X	X
2024	X	1,766	442	1,393	0	X

Bury	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	1,631	401	1,099	0	X
2021	X	2,340	611	1,925	X	0
2022	X	2,454	557	2,165	X	X
2023	X	2,407	563	2,162	X	X
2024	X	2,177	590	1,741	X	8

Rochdale	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	2,717	588	1,552	0	X
2021	X	3,772	882	2,935	X	0
2022	X	3,962	718	3,280	X	X
2023	X	3,520	706	3,155	X	X
2024	X	3,423	763	2,578	X	8

Oldham	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	2,918	535	1,663	X	X
2021	X	4,516	704	2,852	9	X
2022	X	4,102	775	3,065	7	X
2023	X	4,084	837	3,297	21	10
2024	X	3,910	882	2,697	8	8

Other/ Not Recorded/ Unknown	Total Recorded Crimes (Murder)	Total Recorded Crimes (Domestic Violence)	Total Recorded Crimes (Rape & Other Sexual Offences)	Total Recorded Crimes (Stalking & Harassment)	Total Recorded Crimes (Forced Marriage)	Total Recorded Crimes ('Deep Fakes')
2020	X	53	45	34	0	0
2021	X	87	114	54	0	0
2022	X	114	102	58	X	0
2023	X	112	75	86	0	0
2024	X	50	21	42	0	0