



Date: 29/04/2025
Our ref: 01/FOI/25/014547/S

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/25/014547/S

I write in connection with your request for information dated 07/04/2025, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

I am submitting this request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Please provide the following information:

- 1. suicide incidents where loss of benefits has been a factor within the last 5 years.*
- 2. Projected crime rates as a result of potential welfare cuts.*

Please provide this information in electronic format. If any part of this request exceeds the cost threshold, please provide the portions that can be released within the limit and advise on how to refine the request.

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that the information you have requested is not held by GMP.

1. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact the Coroner's Courts for this information.
2. This information is not held. GMP do not hold information relating to events in the future.