



Date: 30/10/2025
Our ref: 01/FOI/25/015589/G

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/25/015589/G

I write in connection with your request for information dated 02/10/2025, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

Fol Request regarding Flooding Event Peel Green Road, Eccles on 19/20/21

Could you please provide me with details regarding:

- a. The overall cost of providing emergency assistance for Greater Manchester on the whole with regarding to flooding for the event described above.*
- b. Is it possible to provide a break down of these costs for this flooding event?*
- c. The number and nature (roles) of the Police Officers assigned to this incident.*

This is a continuance of the Fol request CDS-93727-25-0600-002

However, we now have a specific event to investigate. The aim of the research to develop a more precise system that will calculate the cost of such events in terms of damage incurred and the necessary public services response.

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by GMP.

1. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact Salford City Council, United Utilities and the Environment Agency for this information.

2. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact Salford City Council, United Utilities and the Environment Agency for this information.
3. GMP had 5 incidents reported related to flooding at this location on 20/09/2025 and one on 21/09/2025. No reports were received on 19/09/2025. No police resources were dispatched to any of the incidents.