



Date: 02/10/2025
Our ref: 01/FOI/25/015372/R

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/25/015372/R

I write in connection with your request for information dated 02/10/2025, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

Since Palestine Action was proscribed please can you tell me:

- 1. How many people GMP have arrested for supporting Palestine Action at public protests*
- 2. How many of those people have been charged with the offence of supporting a proscribed organisation*
- 3. How many of the people charged have appeared in court*
- 4. How many have been found guilty and what sentences have they been given*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by GMP.

CAVEATS

Under the Freedom of Information Act, we are only obliged to provide information that is held at the time of the request. The information provided below is what was held when your request was made. The number of individuals charged has since changed. Some further information can be found on the GMP website: [Twelve people charged in relation to protest in Manchester city centre | Greater Manchester Police](#)

1. 37
2. 0
3. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service for this information.
4. This information is not held by GMP. Please contact His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service for this information.