



Date: 20/02/2026
Our ref: 01/FOI/26/016233/G

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/26/016233/G

I write in connection with your request for information dated 26/01/2026, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

1. *How many FOI requests did you receive in 2025?*
2. *How many of those did you action and how many did you reject?*
3. *On average, how many hours did you spend on each FOI that you rejected?*
4. *On average, how many hours did you spend on each FOI that you actioned?*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that the information you have requested is held by GMP.

1. 2,143
2. 938 were refused.
3. This information is not held by GMP.
4. This information is not held by GMP.