



Date: 18/02/2026
Our ref: 01/FOI/25/014753/W

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/25/014753/W

I write in connection with your request for information dated 13/05/2026, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

1. *The number of successful prosecutions secured for exceeding the speed limit on the roads with reference specifically to TRACTORS and/or agricultural vehicles (as opposed to any other vehicle type)*
2. *Please provide tractor/agricultural vehicle speeding prosecution figures for 2022-23, 2023-2024, 2025 so far.*
3. *Can you please identify the HIGHEST illegal tractor/agricultural vehicle speed (in mph) recorded by the force, and what the speed limit of the road was at the time of the offence*
4. *If possible, please provide details of the ultimate prosecution (fine, points on licence, etc) for the individual who recorded the highest speed while driving a tractor/agricultural vehicle.*

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by GMP.

CAVEATS

GMP do not record vehicle classification type when processing speeding offences. The following has been established by searching for vehicle make.

1. This information is not held by GMP. Information relating to prosecutions should be sought from His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service.
2. This information is not held by GMP. Information relating to prosecutions should be sought from His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service.
3. The highest speed recorded by a tractor or agricultural vehicle was 62MPH when the speed limit was 50MPH.
4. This information is not held by GMP. Information relating to prosecutions should be sought from His Majesty's Courts and Tribunal Service.