



Date: 22/12/2025
Our ref: 01/FOI/25/015809/Z

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NO: 01/FOI/25/015809/Z

I write in connection with your request for information dated 05/12/2025, received by Greater Manchester Police (GMP) for the following information:

I wish to make an FOI request. Please provide within 20 working days data for the year ending 31 March 2025:

1. *The total number of arrests of foreign nationals made by your police force for the year ending 31 March 2025.*
2. *The total number of arrests of foreign nationals made by your police force for the year ending 31 March 2025 for the following offence categories:*
 - a) *Sexual offences*
 - b) *Violence against the person*
 - c) *Drug offences*
 - d) *Theft*

Your force has produced similar data for previous years so there should be not difficulty in producing the data.

Result of Searches

Following receipt of your request searches were conducted within Greater Manchester Police (GMP) to locate information relevant to your request. I can confirm that the information you have requested is held by GMP.

CAVEATS

To answer question 1, a report was generated listing all arrests and the arrestee nationality. Arrestees with the nationality of "England", "Isle of Man", "Northern Ireland", "Scotland", "United Kingdom" and "Wales" have been removed.

Entries where the nationality is unknown or not recorded have also been removed. The information provided includes arrests of stateless persons.

Home Office offence categories are not recorded on our custody system. To provide an answer to question 2, the full offence title is provided on the attached spreadsheet. There are 1,089 entries without an offence title entered.

1. 15,015
2. Please see the attached spreadsheet.